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16/2/201.6

To Whom it May Concern,

It is my pleasure to recommend Roman Chernishev for the "head of Moldova's Central
Bank". Roman and I connected through the CFA Institute with which I have been associated
for the past 30 years. I found his academic credentials to be impeccable, professionalism
first rate, intelligence and focus of the highest order. I therefore recommended Roman for
the CFA certification progran, which he completed remarkably well.

Roman assisted me with the teaching of MBA finance at the Peres Academic Center, where I

served as department chair. He provided practical insight and depth as guest lecturer in the
"Bond Management" course for master degree students.

Given his rich practical and academic background in the financial markets, I have no doubt
that Roman will be very successful as the head of Moldova'scentrar Bank.

Itherefore offer my recommendation without reservation. lf you have any questions or
require further information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

Don Elan Ph.D, CFA



To Whom lt May Concern,

I am delighted to have this opportunity to recommend my partner Roman Chernishev for
the position of the " Head of Moldova's Central Bank ".

During the recent couple of years Roman and me founded and developed successful
lmporting company in lsrael. Roman took part as an Investor and a Financial Director in this
project, while my part was the role of Investor and General Manager.

Roman demonstrated highest analytical and managerial skills, deep understanding of all
financial issues, persistence and outstanding communication capabilities. lt is my great
pleasure to work with Roman as a team.

Providing that I know him having profound academic background and rich 
"*p"ri"n." 

in
financial markets, and taking into consideration his personality traits, I enthusiastically
recommend his candidacy for over mentioned position.

I would be glad to provide any further information and assistance if needed.

Sincerely,

Rami Giladi, General Manager of " R.R. Sleeping Goods Ltd ,'



17th February,2016

Dear Sir or Madam

Roman Chernishev - application for Head of Moldova Central Bank

It is my great pleasure to write this letter of recommendation for Roman Chernishev, who
I understand is applying to for the position of Head of the Moldovan Central Bank.

Roman has had many years of experience in the financial markets and his suciess in
obtaining the CFA charter displays that he has a deep and'broad understanding of the
financial markets.

Recently Roman stood and was elected to the Board of the lsrael Society of Investment
Professionals, which represent CFA charterholders in lsrael. His initiative and pro-active
enthusiasm as a member of the Board is much appreciated and makes a valuable
contribution to our work.

Roman has informed me he is applying for the position as Head of the Moldovan Central
Bank, and I believe he has the ability to achieve high success in this role.

With kind regards

Yours faithfully

Matthew Salter

Matthew Salter, CFA

President

lsrael Society of lnvestment Professionals


